
Senate Meeting Agenda
October 10, 2022

I. Call to Order Joshua Freeman

Meeting called to order at 5:04pm

II. Pledge of Allegiance Kennith Woods

III. Moment of Reflection Alaina Appe

IV. Roll Call Matthew Hayes

Sen. Aaliyah Smith

Sen. Alex Soule

Sen. Aliyah Henderson

Sen. Bailey Milburn

Sen. Benjamin Byers

Sen. Bianca Domino

Sen. Elizabeth Fontenot

Sen. Jaclyn Pichon-Ciavarella

Sen. Kennith Woods

Sen. Landen Hinrichs

Sen. Matty Matthews

Sen. Nataviya Owens

Sen. Sierra Lewis

Sen. Thais Gomes

Sen. Alaina Appe

13/15 Senators present, quorum has been met

V. Approval of Minutes Joshua Freeman

Minutes were not sent prior to this meeting. Will be approved next meeting.

VI. Question of the day Matthew Hayes



When do grants close for the semester? (November)

Sen. Matthews receives an outreach point

VII. Reports

A. SGA President Baileigh Picou

Thank you for your participation during homecoming week. We could not have done it
without you. This was the best homecoming week I have been a part of. We need
help with University of Louisiana School Systems donations. We are trying to get
travel shampoos out to homeless people. Share the graphic and let people know they
can donate. This is a great way to get involved. Let us know any ideas for Spring
events so we can have them all planned. We are looking forward to scheduling SGA
week. Each branch will have their own individual day.

B. SGA Chief Justice Michala Torres

Thanks for helping with homecoming. This upcoming Monday from 11-2 is voter
registration tabling in the breezeway. We need people to help with this. Next
Wednesday is the Hunger Free Campus board meeting, which will determine if we
qualify for grant money. Pop-up food pantry that day too. Free Speech Alley is
October 26th from 11-2.

C. SGA Advisor Brendan Daigle

Thank you for helping with homecoming. Bonfire is happening in January. Zach will
need help with that. March 25th is Big Event. This is when the students get together
on teams and places out in the community will contact us and we assign projects for
them to go out and do for the community. Much larger scale event that we will need
help with. Thank you for everything you do.

D. Internal Affairs Chair Bailey Milburn

Last Internal Affairs meeting we went over the Big 3 reports for the month. Thankful
for new appointees.

E. Appropriations Chair Landen Hinrichs

Last week in Appropriations we had a bill tabled that will be brought up next meeting.

F. Student Life Chair Bianca Domino

Student Life has been working on Town Hall Meeting and Stress Less Breakfast. We
are keeping the menu the same as last year. We will keep the topics the same as is
for the Town Hall. October 26th from 5:30-7 is the Senate Social. It will be a costume
party.

G. Senate Chair Joshua Freeman

Thank you for everything with homecoming. We have an SE 101 opening for
tomorrow at 12:30. Continue to recruit.



VIII. Unfinished Business

A. FA22-22 A Finance Bill To Sponsor SGA Communications And Marketing For The

2022-2023 Academic Year

Senate Chair opens floor to the Applicant

Applicant: The biggest problem with this bill was not having an itemized list, so here

it is. This is all for recruiting members to join SGA. Some money will also go to

SGA Week, which involves all 3 branches.

The Senate Chair opens the floor for discussion.

Sen. Pro Tempore Hayes: How will giving out free stuff increase participation?

Applicant: Mass marketing approach, physical reminders will remind people to join

SGA

Sen. Fontenot: Marketing is very important, having a physical reminder is definitely a

good marketing strategy.

Sen. Domino: We need more interaction at our tables, like games and other fun

things are also necessary for recruitment. Handing out free things is great but it

does not draw people to the table.

Sen. Woods: We need more interaction like other tables had. Maybe games or

something in addition to just handing out free stuff.

Sen. Hinrich: Will there be a newsletter?

Applicant: Still working on that.

Senate Chair calls for motion to vote on bill FA22-22

Motion made by Sen. Hinrichs

Seconded by Sen. Matthews

13/13 Senators vote aye, bill is adopted.

B. FA22-24 A Finance Bill To Sponsor SGA Scholarships For Student Advancement
Bill tabled.

IX. New Business



A. FA22-26 A Bill To Appoint Kayla Edwards To The Student Government Association As

Director Of Outreach And Recruitment

Bill referred to the Internal Affairs Committee

B. FA22-27 A Bill to Supply the Student Body with Scantrons
Bill referred to the Appropriations Committee.

X. Announcements and Remarks

Sen. Woods: I love SGA, being a part of this is amazing.

Sen. Hinrichs: great job on homecoming.

Sen. Fontenot: I can help with any flyers that need to be done.

Sen. Domino: Senate Social on October 26th. Be thinking of costume ideas.

XI. Adjournment
Meeting adjourned at 5:51pm


